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Persch Consult GmbH | Chartered Surveyors 
announces change in management 
Hamburg, 01.07.2024 – Persch Consult GmbH, one of the leading bank-independent 
valuation companies in Germany, is pleased to announce a change in management. As of 
01.07.2024, Steffen Berger FRICS and Christian Schuhmann MRICS will take over the 
management of Persch Consult GmbH and thus follow Nikolaus Persch FRICS, the founder 
of Persch Consult GmbH, who will now pursue new private paths. 

Steffen Berger FRICS brings extensive experience and expertise in the field of real estate 
valuation and has successfully taken care of the strategic development of IT and the 
digitalization of processes as Managing Director at Persch Consult GmbH in recent years, 
making significant contributions to the company's success. "I look forward to continuing to 
lead the business of Persch Consult GmbH as CEO together with Christian and to shaping 
the future of the company with our talented team," said Steffen Berger. "We will continue 
to drive innovation and offer our clients digital and clearly structured processes." 

Before joining Persch Consult GmbH, Christian Schuhmann MRICS was Head of Real Estate 
and Collateral Valuation at a major German bank. As a certified appraiser, he has years of 
experience in real estate valuation and is familiar with all internal bank and regulatory 
requirements. He is currently CCO at Persch Consult GmbH and takes care of all matters 
relating to clients, products and processes. "The decisive factor is the client's perspective 
and, in particular, the delivery of quality in accordance with the agreed process and service 
level at the best price," said Christian Schuhmann. "Together with Steffen and the team, I 
look forward to providing our clients with the best possible support and continuing to 
inspire new clients with our service."  

Nikolaus Persch FRICS is leaving the company after 18 years, during which time he has 
made a significant contribution to the further development and growth of the company as 
its founder. "I really enjoyed founding Persch Consult GmbH and seeing it grow, especially 
in recent years. I am proud of what we have achieved together over the years," said 
Nikolaus Persch. "I am glad that I can now hand over the management to Steffen and 
Christian and I am convinced that they will lead the company to further success." 

The tinsa Group, the parent company of Persch Consult GmbH, would also like to thank 
Nikolaus Persch for his outstanding work and looks forward to working with Steffen 
Berger and Christian Schuhmann to write the next chapters in the company's history. 
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